
A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
ANDREA BAUER, Patti’s Gym - IL

Andrea has been taking lessons in tumbling for 11 years and trampoline/double-
mini for 10 years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU
T&T National Team.  Andrea most admires Jenni Konstanty.  Her favorite
sport is cheerleading and her favorite food is pizza.  Other than tumbling &
trampoline, Andrea’s favorite past-time is running.  She is 15 years old and in
the 9th grade at Bureau Valley High School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
SHELBY BROWN, Gymnastics, Etc. - IL

Shelby has been taking lessons in trampoline  for 7 years and double-mini for
6 years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T
National Team.  Her favorite sports are trampoline, cheerleading & volleyball
- her favorite foods are shells & cheese and pasta.  Shelby most admires
Michelle Clardy (her coach) and Patti Lingenfelter.  Other than tumbling &
trampoline, Shelby’s favorite  past-time is cheerleading, playing outside, and
hanging out with her next door neighbor, Lacey, and with other friends.  She is
12 years old and in the 7th grade at Chiddix Jr. High.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
BRITTANY CHAPMAN, Will Power Tumbling - OH

Brittany has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 5
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite sport is tumbling and her favorite food is popcorn.  Brittany
most admires Dianna Jarvis, her teammate from Will Power Tumbling.  Other
than tumbling & trampoline, her favorite pasttime is cheerleading.  Brittanyy
is 12 years old and in the 6th grade at Hannan Trace Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
BRANDIE CHEREPKAI, Elite Energy - IN

Brandie has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 6
years. This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite food is steak and her favorite sports are tumbling & cheer.
Brandie most admires Shelby Young.  Other than tumbling & trampoline,
Brandie’s favorite  past-time is cheer. She is 10 years old and in the 4th grade
at Rio Grande Elementary.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
CHRISTIAN COLE, Studios Unlimited Tumblers - KY

Christian has been taking trampoline & double-mini lessons for 6 years.  This
is the first time he has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.  He
most admires his mom & dad.  His favorite sport is trampoline and his favorite
foods are breakfast foods and his Nana Duncan’s homemade biscuits.  Other
than trampoline & double-mini, Christian’s favorite past-times are  basketball
and football. He is 11 years old and in the 5th grade at Mt. Sterling Christian
School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
CLIFTON CROUCH, TNT - KY

Clifton has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 6
years.  He was a member of the previous AAU T&T National Team for two
years.  His favorite food is steak and his favorite sports are tumbling & soccer.
Clifton most admires his parents.  Other than tumbling & trampoline, Clifton’s
favorite  past-time is soccer.  He is 14 years old and in the 8th grade at St.
Mark.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
AMBER DONALDSON, Studio’s Unlimited Tumblers - KY

Amber has been taking lessons in tumbling for 5 years and trampoline/double-
mini for 4 years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T
National Team.  Her favorite food is spaghetti and her favorite sports are
gymnastics, power tumbling, & trampoline.  She most admires her coaches,
Tina Mobley and Vernetta Duncan-Cole.  Other than tumbling & trampoline,
her favorite past-times are cheerleading and playing yahoo.  Amber is 12 years
old and in the 7th grade at Roy G Eversole Middle School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
PAIGE DOYLE, TNT - KY

Paige has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 7 years.
This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.
Her favorite foods are shrimp & steak - her favorite sports are power  tumbling
& cheerleading.  Brandie most admires her parents, Dallas & Penny Doyle.
Other than tumbling & trampoline, Paige’s favorite  past-times are past-time
is cheerleading, dance, and spending time with friends.  She is 12 years old and
in the 7th grade at Rowan County Middle School.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
ELIZABETH (LIZZIE) EITZEN, Tumbling On USA - IL

Lizzie has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 4 years.
This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.
Lizzie most admires her parents.  Her favorite sport is gymnastics and her
favorite food is pepperoni pizza.  Other than tumbling & trampoline, Lizzie’s
favorite past-time is going shopping with her friends.  She is 13 years old and
in the 7th grade at Century Jr. High.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
MEGHAN FLOYD, Ultra Stars Academy - IN

Meghan has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 3
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite sport is power tumbling and her favorite food is spaghetti.
She   most admires her coach, Amber VanNatta.   Other than tumbling &
trampoline, Meghan’s favorite past-time is hanging out with her friends.  She
is 10 years old and in the 4th grade at Oaklandon Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
CAITLIN GILLIAM, TNT - KY

Caitlin has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 9 years.
This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.
She most admires Bridgett Fannin and Tabitha Price.  Her favorite sports are
tumbling & trampoline and her favorite food is pizza.  Other than tumbling &
trampoline, Lizzie’s favorite past-time is basketball.  She is 11 years old and in
the 5th grade at Morehead Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
BRANDI GRIFFIN, Gotta Flip Gym -OH

Brandi has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for four
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  She most admires her mom.  Her favorite food is macaroni and cheese
and her favorite sports are trampoline and tumbling.  Other than tumbling &
trampoline, Brandi’s favorite past-time is softball.  She is 12 years old and in
the 6th grade at Big Walnut Middle School.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
KELSEY HANLIN, Tumbling Tornados - IL

Kelsey has been taking lessons in trampoline, tumbling, & double-mini for 4
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite sport is basketball and her favorite food is pizza.  Kelsey
most admires her teammate, Heather Davis. Kelsey is 10 years old and in the
4th grade at Spoon River Valley School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
ERIN HARDER, Patti’s Gym - IL

Erin has been taking lessons in tumbling for 13 years and in trampoline/double-
mini for 6 years.  She was a member of the previous AAU T&T National Team
for 4 years.  Her favorite sport is tumbling and her favorite food is Happy Joe’s
Nacho Joe Pizza.  Erin most admires her coach, Patti Lingenfelter.  Other than
tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-time is volleyball.  Erin is 16 years
old and in the 11th grade at Orion High School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
LAUREN JANSSEN, Tumbling Tornados - IL

Lauren has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 6
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite sport is tumbling and her favorite foods are baked beans
and pizza.  Lauren most admires her teammate, Heather Davis.  Other than
tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-times are track, volleyball, and
softball.  Lauren is 12 years old and in the 7th grade at Ingersoll Middle
School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
DIANNA MARJORIE JARVIS, Will Power Tumbling - OH

Dianna has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 12
years.  She was a member of the previous AAU T&T National Team for 2
years.  Her favorite sport is power tumbling and her favorite foods are chicken
and broccoli alfredo.  Dianna most admires her coach, Debbie Barber.  Other
than tumbling & trampoline, her favorite past-times are going to the movies and
reading.  Dianna is 17 years old and in the 12th grade at Gallia Academy High
School.  She is also taking courses at the University of Rio Grande.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
DAVID JOHNS, TNT - KY

David has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 8½
years.  This is the first time David has been a member of the AAU T&T
National Team.  His favorite sport is tumbling and his favorite food is
cucumbers.  He most admires his coach, David Pollitte.  Other than tumbling
and trampoline, David’s favorite past-time is football.  David is 15 years old
and in the 9th grade at Bath County High School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
ANDREW KNAPP, Patti’s Gym - IL

Andrew has been taking lessons in tumbling for 9 years and in
trampoline/double-mini for 3 years.  This is the first time he has been a member
of the AAU T&T National Team.  He most admires his coach, Patti
Lingenfelter.  Andrew’s favorite sports are basketball and tumbling - his
favorite food is Kentucky Fried Chicken.  Other than tumbling & trampoline,
his favorite past-time is playing basketball.  Andrew is 13 years old and in the
7th grade at Sterling Christian School. 

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
SARAH KRIZ, Patti’s Gym - IL

Sarah has been taking lessons in tumbling for ten years and in
trampoline/double-mini for eight.  This is the first time she has been a member
of the AAU T&T National Team.  Her favorite sport is double-mini and her
favorite food is ice cream.  Sarah most admires Sarah Mullens.  In addition to
tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-time is fishing.  Sarah is 16 years old
and is in the 10th grade at Bureau Valley High School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
COLLINS KURKOWSKI, TNT - KY

Collins has been taking lessons in tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini for 5
years.  She was a member of the previous AAU T&T National Team for 2
years.  Collins most admires her grandmother, grandfather, mom, & dad.  Her
favorite sports are tumbling & trampoline - her favorite foods are corn and
pizza.  She is 12 years old and in the 6th grade at Pikeville Elementary. 



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
JERRICA LAMBERT, Studios Unlimited Tumblers - KY

Jerrica has been taking lessons in tumbling for 6 years and trampoline/double-
mini for 5 years.  This is the first time Jerrica has been a member of the AAU
T&T National Team.  Her favorite sport is gymnastics and her favorite food is
pizza.  She most admires her coaches, Vernetta and Tina.  Other than tumbling
and trampoline, her favorite past-time is cheerleading.  Jerrica is 11 years old
and in the 6th grade at Buckham Elementary School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
SAMMIE LEWIS, Mid-American Gym - OH

Sammie has been taking lessons in tumbling for 9 years and in
trampoline/double-mini for 5 years.  This is the first time Sammie has been a
member of the AAU T&T National Team.  Her favorite sports are running and
tumbling and her favorite food is fajitas.  She most admires her big sister
because she is such a great person and good role model.  Other than tumbling
& trampoline, Sammie’s favorite past-time is cross country.  She is 14 (15 in
June) years old and in the 9th grade at Valley High School.               

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
RACHEL MARTIN, Gotta Flip Gym - OH

Rachel has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for four
years.  This is the first time Rachel has been a member of the AAU T&T
National Team.  Her favorite sports are gymnastics, tumbling, & trampoline.
She most admires Brittany M.  Her favorite food is pizza.  Other than tumbling
and trampoline, her favorite past-time is shopping.  Rachel is 13 years old and
in the 7th grade at Hamilton Middle School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
SARAH MAYNORD, Patti’s Gym - IL

Sarah has been taking lessons in tumbling for six years and in
trampoline/double-mini for five years.  She was a member of the previous AAU
T&T National Team for two years.  Her favorite sports are tumbling,
trampoline, & double-mini and her favorite food is chicken fingers.  Sarah most
admires her mom, Patti Lingenfelter (her coach), Whoopi Konstanty, and Angie
Boline.  Other than tumbling & trampoline, her favorite past-time is hanging out
with her friends.  Sarah is 12 years old and in the 6th grade at Logan Junior
High.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
LACEE MEFFORD, TNT - KY

Lacee has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 4 years.
This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.
Her favorite sports are tumbling and trampoline and her favorite food is corn.
Lacee most admires David Pollitte (her coach), Lori Lundergan, and Nicolle
Wolf.  In addition to tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-time is
basketball. Lacee is 10 years old and in the 4th grade at Jones Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
JADE MORGAN, TNT - KY

Jade has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 3 years.
She was on the previous AAU T&T National Team for two years.  Her favorite
sport is gymnastics and her favorite food is chocolate!!  Jade most admires her
team-mate, Erin Rummage.  Other than tumbling & trampoline, her favorite
past-time is cheerleading.  Jade is 10 years old and in the 5th grade at Mason
County Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
AUSTIN NACEY, GymStar Gym - IL

Austin has been taking tumbling lessons for two years.  This is the first time he
has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.  His favorite sports are
cross country and track - his favorite food is shrimp.  Austin most admires
Jason Gatson.  Other than tumbling, his favorite past-time is playing with his
dogs.  Austin is 10 years old and in the 4th grade at Reed Custer Intermediate
School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
KAILEE PAKENHAM, Patti’s Gym - IL

Kailee has been taking lessons in tumbling for 7 years and in
trampoline/double-mini for 4 years.  This is the first time she has been a
member of the AAU T&T National Team.  Her favorite sport is tumbling and
her favorite food is pizza.  Kailee most admires her mom and her coach, Patti
Lingenfelter.  Other than tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-times are
softball and shopping.  Kailee is 11 years old and in the 5th grade at
Northbrook Middle School.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
KAYLI POLLITTE, TNT - KY

Kayli has been taking tumbling, trampoline, and double-mini lessons for 14
years.  She was a member of the previous AAU T&T National Team for two
years.  Her favorite sports are tumbling & trampoline (of course) and her
favorite food is strawberries.  Kayli most admires Lori Lundergan and Bridgett
Fannin.  In addition to tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-time is
singing.  She is 17 years old and in the 11th grade at Rowan County Senior
High School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
KATIE REDMOND, TNT - KY

Katie has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 3 years.
This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National Team.
She  most admires her mom.  Katie’s favorite sports are tumbling and
trampoline - her favorite food is mashed potatoes.  Other than tumbling and
trampoline, her favorite past-time is playing with friends.  Katie is 10 (11 in
June) years old and in the 5th grade at Jones Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
JOE ROARK, Team Flip - IA

Joe has been taking lessons in tumbling for 9 years and in trampoline/ double-
mini for 2 years.  This is the first time he has been a member of the AAU T&T
National Team.  His favorite sport is gymnastics and his favorite food is
chocolate chip pancakes.  He most admires Olympic Gymnast, Chaney
Umphrey.  Other than tumbling and trampoline, his favorite past-time is playing
with his friends.  Joe is 12 years old and in the 6th grade at Horace Mann
Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
JORDAN SALYERS, Patti’s Gym - IL

Jordan has been taking lessons in tumbling for 4 years, in trampoline for 2
years, and in double-mini for 3 years.  He was a member of the previous AAU
T&T National Team for four years.  Jordan’s favorite sports are tumbling and
track - his favorite food is pizza.  He most admires Jason Zulauf and his coach,
Patti Lingenfelter.  Other than tumbling and trampoline, his favorite past-times
are cars and music.  Jordan is 16 years old and in his sophomore year at
Roseniele High School.



A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
JESSICA SIMON, Aerials & Baranis Gymnastic Center - MI

Jessica has been taking lessons in tumbling & trampoline for 6 years and in
double-mini for 3 years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the
AAU T&T National Team.  Her favorite sport is gymnastics and her favorite
foods are grilled cheese sandwiches & ice cream.  Jessica most admires her
parents.  Other than tumbling and trampoline, her favorite past-time is
cheerleading.  Jessica is 14 years old and in the 9th grade at Chippewa Hills
High School.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
PHOENIX SMALLWOOD, Patti’s Gym - IL

Phoenix has been taking lessons in tumbling for 3 years and in trampoline &
double-mini for 2 years.  This is the first time Phoenix has been a member of
the AAU T&T National Team.  Her favorite sports are tumbling, trampoline,
& double-mini and her favorite food is corn on the cob.  Phoenix most admires
her coach, Patti Lingenfelter.  Other than tumbling & trampoline, her favorite
past-times are baseball and shopping.  Phoenix is 9 years old and in the 3rd
grade at Lincoln Elementary.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
TRISTAN VAN NATTA, Ultra Stars Flipside - IN

Tristan has been taking tumbling, trampoline, and double-mini lessons for 6
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite sports are trampoline and gymnastics - her favorite food
is  ice cream.  Tristan most admires Morgan White and Dmitri.  Other than
tumbling & trampoline, her favorite past-times are horseback riding and
swimming.  Tristan is 8 years old and in the 3rd grade.  She is home-schooled.

A.A.U. TUMBLING & TRAMPOLINE NATIONAL TEAM MEMBER:
CARLEY YOUNG, Elite Energy - IN

Carley has been taking tumbling, trampoline, & double-mini lessons for 6
years.  This is the first time she has been a member of the AAU T&T National
Team.  Her favorite sport is tumbling and her favorite food is macaroni and
cheese.  Carley most admires her coach, Dan Patton.  Other than tumbling and
trampoline, her favorite past-time is cheer.  Carley is 8 years old and in the 2nd
grade at Rio Grande Elementary.


